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Context

Welcome to the BRAINFINITY Teacher Training program, an
innovative approach designed for teachers of students aged 11-14. It
has been created within The Brainfinity Detectives - Collaborative
Problem Solving Challenge - Strategic Partnership in School
Education project co-funded by the EU Commission's Erasmus+
Program under Project Nr: 2022-1-PT01-KA220-SCH-000086691.This
project brings together a diverse mix of participants, including schools,
NGOs, companies, and training experts, spanning across Portugal,
Slovenia, Bulgaria, and Serbia. Our goal is to empower educators with
the skills and knowledge to foster problem-solving abilities in their
students through the engaging and thought-provoking use of detective
tasks.

This training program is rooted in the specific objective of educating
teachers to create and implement detective tasks that encourage
students to think critically, research effectively, and synthesize
information from various sources. By doing so, we aim to stimulate the
development of functional knowledge among learners. This approach
aligns with the overall objectives of our project, which focuses on
enhancing teachers' abilities to motivate and engage students, while
also facilitating a reorganization of traditional teaching methods.
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PART 1 - THEORETICAL PART
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1.1 Introduction to Brainfinity teachers’ training
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Recognizing the need for innovative and comprehensive
methodologies in developing problem-solving skills, our Serbian
partner has successfully piloted the Brainfinity methodology. This
approach, which utilizes detective tasks to cultivate problem-solving
skills, has shown promising results during its initial phase in 2020.
However, we are adapting this methodology for international
application to achieve a broader impact.

A unique aspect of this program is its focus on problem-solving skills
through detective tasks, a method not extensively explored at the EU
level. The program facilitates learning and enables teachers to
develop the most effective strategies for their students. Continuous
improvement is a key feature, with enhancements based on insights
from pilot testing.



Daniel Gallego

Objectives of the training

The Brainfinity teachers' training program aims to equip educators with
the skills to enhance problem-solving and critical thinking in students
aged 11-14 through interactive, detective-themed educational
activities.

The BRAINFINITY teacher training will equip educators with diverse
methods, tools, good practices, and real-life examples to implement in
their classrooms. It includes clear instructions on how to integrate
detective tasks into their teaching, covering aspects such as:

Steps for creating engaging detective tasks.
Essential requirements that these tasks must meet.
Tailored training programs that guide teachers in formulating and
implementing these tasks effectively.

By participating in this training, teachers will be well-prepared to bring
a dynamic and interactive learning experience to their classrooms that
captivates young minds and significantly boosts their problem-solving
skills.
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Anticipated outcomes

The Brainfinity teachers' training program is designed to enhance the
educational landscape significantly. Key anticipated outcomes include
teachers developing advanced skills in creating and implementing
detective-themed problem-solving tasks, leading to more engaging
and age-appropriate student challenges. This approach is expected to
increase student engagement and interest in learning, particularly in
problem-solving activities, making education more interactive and
enjoyable.

Students will benefit from improved critical thinking and analytical
skills, essential for academic and real-life problem-solving. The
training also aims to boost teacher confidence and competence in
facilitating these activities, fostering a collaborative spirit among
students for group problem-solving tasks. Overall, this innovative
approach is set to positively influence school culture, nurturing a love
for learning and intellectual curiosity.
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From the project's title, it may be inferred that teachers are expected
to possess highly developed quantitative skills. While a strong
foundation in quantitative knowledge, especially in working with data,
is necessary for good performance in the Brainfinity competition, it is
not expected that the teacher mentor be an expert in mathematics and
related disciplines. For successful team leadership in the competition
and the implementation of the Brainfinity Detectives project principles
in regular teaching, it is most important for the teacher to develop key
soft skills.

First and foremost, teachers must understand the cognitive and
affective processes that students go through while solving problems.
This understanding is crucial because it enables teachers to guide
students more effectively, fostering an environment where critical
thinking and problem-solving skills can thrive. Participating in
problem-solving team workshops is essential for teachers. These
workshops are designed to provide hands-on experience, allowing
teachers to engage in solving problems themselves. This practical
involvement helps teachers to identify the cognitive and affective
processes they experience on a metacognitive level, which in turn
enhances their ability to empathize with and support their students.

1.2 Teacher’s skills required for this project
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Additionally, teachers should be adept at identifying learning
outcomes through problem-solving. Recognizing these outcomes is
vital for tailoring instruction to meet students' needs and for ensuring
that the problem-solving activities are aligned with educational goals.
Teachers preparing for Brainfinity mentorship need to independently
organize themselves into teams and solve Brainfinity problems. This
collaborative approach not only mirrors the student experience but
also fosters a sense of camaraderie and shared purpose among
teachers.

The continuation of the workshop involves a critical self-assessment
of solutions and teamwork. Teachers will provide constructive
feedback to other teams, focusing on both the solutions presented and
the teamwork dynamics observed. This feedback loop is essential for
continuous improvement and for developing a reflective practice
among teachers. Following this, teachers in teams identify learning
outcomes from their problem-solving activities. A thorough discussion
about these outcomes takes place among all workshop participants,
providing a platform for sharing insights and strategies.

In summary, while quantitative skills are beneficial, the emphasis of
the Brainfinity Detectives project is on developing soft skills,
understanding cognitive and affective processes, and fostering a
collaborative and reflective practice among teachers. These elements
are crucial for successfully leading student teams in the Brainfinity
competition and for integrating problem-solving and critical thinking
into everyday teaching practices.
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A very important activity for teachers is coming up with Brainfinity
problems. In this activity, teachers awaken their creativity and deepen
their understanding of learning outcomes, which is crucial for
Brainfinity competition mentors. It's important that the problems meet
specific criteria, namely: they should be engaging for the intended age
group, adequately challenging but not overly difficult, promote
teamwork, require students to engage in research, act as a
motivational force in the learning process, foster the development of
crucial life skills alongside academic knowledge.

Mentoring students in the art of arguing positions is a crucial aspect of
developing their critical thinking and communication skills. Arguing
positions is not just about stating an opinion; it involves presenting a
well-reasoned case, supported by evidence, to persuade others of a
particular viewpoint. Here's an elaboration on the steps and practices
involved:

Defining the Stance: It's essential for students to start by clearly
articulating their position on a topic. This step involves understanding
the core of what they are asserting and being able to succinctly state
their viewpoint.

1.3 Mentoring students in the arguing position process
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Gathering Relevant Information: Students should be encouraged to
research their topic thoroughly. This means looking for information
from reliable sources, understanding the context of the issue, and
gathering facts that are pertinent to their stance.

Providing Evidence: The strength of an argument often lies in the
evidence provided. Students should learn to back up their assertions
with credible sources, including facts, examples, statistics, and expert
opinions. This not only strengthens their argument but also
demonstrates their understanding of the topic.

Considering Counterarguments: A critical aspect of arguing a
position is acknowledging and addressing opposing viewpoints. This
shows that the student has  considered the topic from multiple angles
and is prepared to discuss and refute counterpoints logically.

Maintaining Logical Structure: Organizing arguments in a coherent
and logical manner is key. This involves structuring the argument in a
way that is easy to follow and makes logical sense, leading the
audience through the reasoning process step by step.

Using Persuasive Language: The choice of words and phrases can
significantly impact the persuasiveness of an argument. Students
should be guided to use language that is convincing, assertive, and
resonates with their audience.
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Being Open to Discussion: Effective argumentation is not just about
presenting a case; it's also about engaging in dialogue. Students
should be open to questions, willing to discuss different aspects of the
topic, and able to engage in constructive debate.

Concluding Effectively: Summarizing the main points and reinforcing
the stance at the end of the argument is crucial. A strong conclusion
leaves a lasting impression and succinctly encapsulates the essence
of the argument.

To practice these skills, a practical exercise like debating the
popularity of different sports can be very effective. This exercise not
only engages students in a topic that is often of personal interest but
also challenges them to apply the steps of argumentation. By dividing
them into groups and having them defend a particular sport's
popularity, students are encouraged to research, gather evidence, and
present structured arguments. 

During the presentations and subsequent debate, the focus should be
on distinguishing between mere opinions and well-supported
arguments. It's also an opportunity to discuss the credibility of different
data sources and the importance of using reliable information. This
exercise hones their argumentation skills and fosters critical thinking,
research skills, and the ability to engage in respectful and productive
discussions.
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For more practical exercises in developing students’ skills needed for
effective detectives’ tasks solving, please refer to the Brainfinity
Educational content (WP2)
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Brainfinity problems are designed to develop the most important skills
of today's era, the era of the Fourth Industrial Revolution. These skills
primarily include problem-solving, creative thinking, critical thinking,
teamwork, communication, collaboration with artificial intelligence,
data analysis, and the use of information technologies. 

The problems are from real-life contexts or closely resemble real-life
situations, and they are tailored to students' experiences and interests.
The language used is familiar to students, and the context is intriguing,
capturing their attention and prompting them to engage all their
intellectual capacities.

Solvers are encouraged to utilize all possible resources, from
assistance from friends and experts to the use of various applications
and artificial intelligence. 

There are several types of Brainfinity problems, and below are
descriptions of their characteristics along with corresponding
examples. They are grouped in two main categories: Logical Puzzles
and Detective’s problems.

Logical puzzles: 
Open ended logical puzzle
Logical puzzles with unique solutions

PART 2 BRAINFINITY LOGIC PUZZLES AND TASKS
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Brainfinity detectives’ tasks:
Brainfinity detective problems with unique solution
Open-ended Brainfinity detective’s problems
Deciphering

The logic puzzles and tasks presented in the next sections serve as
examples of this type of problems. Additional versions of these
problems, designed for practice, are included in the booklet.

2.1 Open ended logical puzzle

These problems focus on the development of logical and algorithmic
thinking. They represent the lower levels of higher-order thinking, yet
it's crucial to develop them as they serve as powerful tools in problem-
solving. Problems in this group are open-ended, meaning there are
multiple solutions, but solutions may differ based on criteria not
explicitly stated in the problem itself. This opens up the possibility for
quality discussions about solutions, fostering the development of
critical thinking and communication skills. It's best for such problems to
closely resemble real-world issues, as problems of this type are often
encountered in the job market and daily life. Problem 1 is an example
of this type of problem.
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Problem 1: Doctors Schedule



2.2 Logical puzzles with unique solution

Like problems from the previous type, these problems also develop
algorithmic and logical thinking, with a greater emphasis here. They
have a unique solution, and it's easy to verify whether the solution
obtained is correct, i.e., whether it satisfies all the criteria (clues).
These are problems of the so-called Einstein puzzles, which you can
learn more about at the following link. You can find more problems of
this type at the following link, where you can choose the difficulty and
size of the problems. Please note that the problems on this link may
not have the best-structured narrative, but they can be useful for
further enhancing your logical and algorithmic thinking. Problems 2
and 3 are examples of this type of problem.

Problem 2: Weight Loss

17

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=1rDVz_Fb6HQ
https://logic.puzzlebaron.com/
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Problem 3: Mobile Apps



2.3 Brainfinity detective problems with unique solution

These problems have proven to be the most engaging for students
and represent the core of the Brainfinity project. They are detective
problems with very interesting contexts closely aligned with students'
interests. These problems challenge students to explore and
collaborate as a team to solve them. 

In addition to logical and algorithmic thinking, they also develop
associative thinking, collaboration with artificial intelligence, and the
use of information technologies. Many of these problems also develop
quantitative skills. 

The closed nature of the solutions has its pros and cons. On the
downside, it limits creativity, but on the upside, solvers can be
confident they've found the correct solution, and evaluation is
straightforward. This closed nature allows these problems to be
transformed into escape room-type challenges. 

Even in team-building activities within companies, collaborative solving
of such problems is recommended, but it's challenging to find these
problems online. Developing these problems is one of the main goals
of this project. The following problems illustrate this type.

19
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Problem 4: Journey

Problem 5: Santa Claus
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Problem 6: Actor
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Problem 7: Lost Friend



2.4 Open-ended Brainfinity detective problems

Unlike the problems of the previous type, the solution is not unique in
these detective puzzles. This emphasizes the development of creative
and critical thinking in solvers, particularly the skill of decision-making.
It also opens up the possibility of organizing discussions about
problem solutions, with a special focus on criteria that are not explicitly
stated.
 Like the previous type of problems, these problems are highly
attractive to students. The following problems illustrate this type, with
the first being a transitional variant between these two types. It
presents a problem with a unique solution until the final step, where
divergent thinking comes into play.

Problem 8: Leader

23
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Problem 9: Aliens on Mars
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Problem 10: FBI
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Problem 11: Syracuse
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2.5 Deciphering

Cryptanalysis is the study of analyzing and deciphering codes or
ciphers in order to understand their content without having access to
the key or algorithm used for encryption. It involves techniques such
as frequency analysis, pattern recognition, and mathematical analysis
to break the encryption and reveal the original message. Cryptanalysis
is essential in the field of cryptography for testing the strength of
encryption methods and developing stronger algorithms to protect
sensitive information.

These problems are very interesting to students and mentally quite
demanding. Additionally, solving them requires students to have a high
level of quantitative skills, developed divergent thinking, and creativity.
Cryptanalysis often involves mathematical concepts such as
probability, algebra, and number theory. By engaging in cryptanalysis
activities, students can improve their mathematical skills in a practical
and engaging way.

Understanding how encryption works and how it can be broken helps
kids become more aware of cybersecurity issues. They learn the
importance of protecting their personal information and the
consequences of weak encryption methods.

Cryptanalysis sometimes requires thinking outside the box and coming
up with innovative approaches to break codes. Encouraging kids to
engage in cryptanalysis fosters creativity and innovation.
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Cryptanalysis is a valuable skill in various fields, including
cybersecurity, intelligence, and law enforcement. Introducing kids to
cryptanalysis at a young age can spark their interest in these fields
and prepare them for future career opportunities.

Overall, solving problems from cryptanalysis not only equips students
with valuable skills but also empowers them to become more informed
and responsible digital citizens.

The following tasks illustrate cryptanalysis problems adapted for
students. All of these problems contain basic concepts of cryptography
within them.

Problem 12: Decode the message
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Problem 13: Fibonacci
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Problem 14: Scientist's message



Our aim is to train you in this section to create Brainfinity problems on
your own so that you can improve your teaching practice and
successfully organize a Brainfinity competition in your community. As
you have seen in the previous chapter, solving Brainfinity problems
requires a range of skills important in today's world, and creating
problems requires even more. Especially in creating Brainfinity
problems, it's important to think outside the box, to let your imagination
run wild, and to let your creativity flow.

It's crucial to harness the synergy of the team because it expands your
mental horizons and boosts your creativity. So, everything you do
within this training is in collaboration with the team, and you strive to
listen to each other, respect others' opinions and arguments, and help
team members give their intellectual best in this challenging task.

We've divided this training into five phases, which are not evenly
distributed in terms of duration or the level of demand.
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PART 3 TEACHER TRAINING
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3.1 Building Brainfinity skills

To successfully create a Brainfinity problem, you must first become
familiar with this type of problem directly. You will best do this by
solving problems. In this phase, you will work on solving the 14
problems listed in Chapter 2, exactly in that order. In problems 2 and
3, you can use the tool at the link. Please follow the important stages
in problem-solving.

3.1.1 Stage 1: Brainstorming

Brainstorming is a creative problem-solving technique used to
generate a large number of ideas or solutions to a specific problem or
challenge. 

Create a comfortable and relaxed environment conducive to free
thinking. Start by clearly defining the problem. This sets the focus for
the brainstorming session. 

Encourage you and your teammates to suspend judgment and
criticism during the brainstorming process. Generate as many ideas as
possible, regardless of feasibility or quality. Quantity is key at this
stage. Ideas should be brief and to the point. 

Think creatively and explore different perspectives. Build your ideas on
ideas of your team mates. One idea may spark another, leading to
even more creative solutions. 

https://www.jsingler.de/apps/logikloeser/?language=en#(at:s,items:!(!(Steffi,George,Barack,Carla,Roger),!(Cambridge,Obama,Graf,Federer,Bruni),!('1969','2013','1961','1967','1981'),!(CH,UK,D,USA,F)),ms:t,n:!(),nc:4,ni:5,p:!(),v:0)


3.1.2 Stage 2: Evaluation and selection of ideas

3.1.3 Stage 3: Action Planning 
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After the brainstorming session, review the list of ideas and identify
those that stand out or have the most potential. Refine and consolidate
similar ideas. Evaluate the ideas based on criteria such as feasibility,
effectiveness, and alignment with goals. Select the most promising
ideas to pursue further.

Record all ideas without judgment or evaluation. This can be done on
a whiteboard, flip chart, or digital document where everyone can see
the proposed ideas. 

Brainstorming is a versatile technique that can be used in various
settings, from business meetings to classroom activities, to generate
creative solutions to problems and stimulate innovation.

Develop an action plan for implementing the selected ideas. Assign
responsibilities and establish a plan for monitoring progress. If
necessary, divide the problem into several parts and assign roles,
specifying who will do what in the team.



3.1.4 Stage 4: Investigation

3.1.5 Stage 5: Formulating the solution

This is the phase where all the pieces need to come together into one
solution. In this phase, it's important to formulate the solution in a way
that is understandable and convincing to everyone. Here, you should
use some classic techniques of critical thinking. 

Imagine first that your team is presenting this solution to a client whom
you need to persuade of the accuracy and effectiveness of your
solution. 

Also, imagine if someone else presented this solution to you as a
client; would you be satisfied? 

Finally, consider your solution as if it were from a competing team and
try to critique it. After passing through these three tests, formulate the
final solution. Upload your solution as a Google document.
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In accordance with the action plan, conduct all necessary research
and record the conclusions you have reached. This phase can be
conducted collaboratively, or each team member can conduct it
individually, according to the assigned roles.



3.1.6 Stage 6: Group-level evaluation

Solution of Team 1

Do you think the
solution meets the
problem
requirements? If
not, please
explain why.

Is the solution clear
and easy to read?
Enter improvements
if needed.

What would you
specifically
commend about this
solution?

Team 1

Team 2
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In this phase, all solutions should be visible to all groups. Teams then
work on evaluating the solutions of other teams using the provided
tables, which should be open in a Google document visible to all
teams. (Expand the table according to the number of teams.)

For some problems, these tables will be quite sparse, while for others,
you will spend a long time working on the texts. It all depends on the
nature of the problem and the quality of the solutions. After this, you
should conduct a final rounding of the solutions, which we don't have
to consider as a separate phase.



3.2 Identifying cognitive processes

This part of the training is crucial for empowering you to develop the
skills of creating appropriate detective problems. It is important that the
problems stimulate the development of higher-order thinking. 

In this regard, for this training segment, it is essential to consider
Bloom's taxonomy of learning outcomes. The problems themselves
are closely connected to reality, so a large number of outcomes will fall
within the domain of application. From this perspective, you should be
encouraged to identify outcomes in the domains of analysis, synthesis,
and evaluation.

Metacognition is crucial for identifying outcomes. Metacognition is the
ability to think about one's own thinking process. It involves being
aware of and understanding how you solve problems, make decisions,
and regulate your cognitive processes. Metacognition allows
individuals to monitor and control their cognitive activities, such as
planning, monitoring progress, evaluating strategies, and making
adjustments as needed. It plays a crucial role in learning and problem-
solving by helping individuals become more effective learners and
thinkers. 
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For this reason, training in this domain begins by brainstorming in
teams on listing cognitive processes you identify through problem
solving activities of the previous stage of training. First, as a team,
identify the cognitive processes for each problem individually, and then
enter into the table below those outcomes that no team has entered
yet. For each specific cognitive process, find the appropriate category
in Bloom's taxonomy.

Remembering:
Recalling facts,
information, or
concepts from
memory.

Understanding:
Comprehending
and interpreting
information,
including
explaining ideas
or concepts in
one's own
words.

Applying:
Using
knowledge or
concepts in new
or practical
situations.

Applying:
Using
knowledge or
concepts in new
or practical
situations.
Analyzing:
Breaking down
information into
its component
parts and
examining the
relationships
between them.

Evaluating:
Making
judgments or
assessments
based on
criteria and
standards.

Creating:
Generating new
ideas, products, or
solutions based on
existing knowledge
or concepts.

Problem1

Problem2

Problem3

Problem4

...
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3.3 Creating logic-puzzle problems

We have reached the first phase of the training where you are
expected to create problems. This is not a completely free phase;
rather, you work in a semi-structured environment. Namely, your task
is to download one problem of your team's choice from the link and
restructure its narrative to be engaging and understandable for
students. Be mindful that even very small changes can disrupt the
logical structure of the problem. Creativity is expected from you, but
within the logical rules imposed by the problem you have chosen. If
your team feels ready to independently create problems of this type,
you can attempt to do so.

In this section, it's important to follow the steps that will gradually lead
you to a satisfactory logical puzzle of the Einstein type. The following
text describes these steps.

3.3.1 Brainstorming

Use the brainstorming technique to choose the problem you will
revise, as well as to generate ideas about changing the narrative of
the problem.

https://logic.puzzlebaron.com/
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3.3.2 Solving

Solve the puzzle using the methodology consistent with the section
where you solved problems (the second and third problem). Record
each step while solving. When you reach the final solution, review your
steps and try to minimize the number of steps and simplify them to
make them as clear as possible to the reader.

3.3.3 Creating

In this part, your task is to collaboratively devise a text that serves as
an introduction to the logic puzzle (up to 1000 characters). This text
(stimulus) should motivate students to engage in problem-solving.
Afterward, adapt all clues to fit this text and further animate them to be
as engaging as possible for students.

3.3.4 Verification

Go through the puzzle again, as if you don't know the solution, and
check if the logical structure of the puzzle has been compromised.

3.3.5 Adapting the solution

Now, return to the solution of the original puzzle and reformulate it to
fit your creation.
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3.3.6 Group-level evaluation

In this phase, all problems with solutions should be visible to all
groups. Teams then work on solving and evaluating the puzzles and
solutions of other teams using the provided tables, which should be
open in a Google document visible to all teams. Don't read the solution
before solving the problem yourself to verify if the puzzle is logically
consistent and to determine its difficulty. (Expand the table according
to the number of teams.)

Logical puzzle of Team 1

Is the puzzle text
understandable?
Write
suggestions for
improvement.

Is there a solution
that satisfies all the
clues, and is it
unique?

Is the solution
clear and easy to
read? Enter
improvements if
needed.

Estimate the
difficulty of the
problem.

1

2
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3.3.7 Finishing the puzzle

When you've read all the comments for your puzzle, make the
appropriate changes, and enter your puzzle and solution into the table
below.

FRAME FOR THE LOGIC PUZZLES

Team

Title of the logic puzzle

Intro story - up to 1000 characters

Clues leading to solution
(5 to 10 clues, depending on the level of
difficulty of the puzzle)

Solution



3.4 Creating Brainfinity detective problem

3.4.1 Choice of problem type
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We've reached the most important phase of your training. We believe
that by going through the previous stages, you are prepared both
intellectually and emotionally to create your own Brainfinity detective
problem. You'll need to engage all your intellectual and creative
capacities to successfully complete this task. Team collaboration is
crucial, as well as following the steps we outline for you.

At the outset, you need to decide which type of Brainfinity problem you
want to create. You can choose one of three types: Brainfinity
detective problem with unique solution, Open ended Brainfinity
detective problem or Deciphering.



3.4.2 Brainstorming

3.4.3 Exploring
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Like other activities so far, we start this one with brainstorming. This
time, you must be much more patient and listen to each other much
more. Generate as many ideas as possible about what the context of
your problem could be. With the context, you should also come up with
basic ideas to develop the context into a detective problem. After
exhausting all ideas, carefully analyze each one and choose what will
be the context of your problem, as well as the basic ideas for creating
the problem. In this phase, use everything that will stimulate divergent
thinking and creativity, primarily internet search engines and artificial
intelligence.

Now that you have the basic context of the problem and the main
ideas around which the problem will be formed, you move on to the
research phase. While researching the context of the problem, share
with the team and write down any ideas you come across that could
be useful for creating the problem. Once you've exhausted your
research capacity, review all the ideas, reformulate them if necessary,
and sort them to prepare for the next phase - creating the problem.



3.4.4 Creating

3.4.5 Solution
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Now we're at the peak of your training. This is the moment when you
need to be most creative. Based on the ideas and data you've listed,
you need to create a story. Be sure to include an introductory story (no
more than 1000 characters) before formulating the problem itself. The
introductory story must intrigue students and motivate them to engage
in solving the problem. Therefore, the narrative of the entire problem
should be tailored to students. The problem statement should not
exceed 2000 characters and should be as unambiguous as possible.

Once you have formulated the problem, write down the solution step
by step. If during the writing of the solution you realize that some step
is too difficult or, conversely, some conclusions are reached too easily,
you can return to the problem formulation and add or remove some
assistance. After that, share the problem formulation, without the
solution, as a Google document with the other teams.



3.4.6 Group-level evaluation of Brainfinity detective problems

Brainfinity detective problem of Team 1

Is the problem
formulation clear and
suitable for students?
Enter suggestions for
improvement.

Estimate the difficulty of
the problem. Which steps
in solving presented a
particular challenge, and
why?

What would you highlight
as good practice in
formulation of the
problem?

1

2
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This is probably the most interesting part of the training, where you
solve problems for each other. Be sure that while solving, you also
analyze the problem and record all the steps in solving, both those
leading you to the solution and those leading you astray. This is
important so that you can assess the difficulty and consistency of the
problem. After that, fill in the table below for the problem you solved.



3.4.7 Instructions for evaluating the problem solution
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Imagine now that you're on the jury of a Brainfinity competition and
you need to evaluate a team's solution. To do this successfully, you
need to anticipate what students are capable of doing on this problem
and how you will assess it. The way other teams have solved your
problem can also help you with this. So, describe in as much detail as
possible how you will evaluate each likely step in solving your
problem. In real practice, there is a high probability that a solution will
appear that you did not anticipate with your evaluation instructions.
The jury specifically deals with such solutions and evaluates their
quality compared to the quality of the official and other solutions.



Page 1

48

3.4.8 Group-level evaluation of solutions and of Brainfinity
detective problems

Now you need to share the solution to your problem and the
evaluation instructions with all the teams. Then, you will evaluate the
solutions and evaluation instructions for the problems of other teams
by completing the table below.

Solution of the Brainfinity detective problem of Team 1

Is each step in the solution clear?
Suggest improvements.

Would you change anything in the
evaluation instructions? Explain why
and how.

1

2
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Now carefully read all the feedback on your problem, both on the
formulation and solution and evaluation instructions. Make changes
that will improve your problem and enter the finished product into the
table below.

FRAME FOR DETECTIVE’S PROBLEMS

3.4.9 Finished product

Team

Title of detectives task

Type of Brainfinity problem

Materials needed (?)

Intro story - up to 1000 characters

Formulation of the task - up to 2000
characters

Suggestions for visual identity and problem
design

Instructions for evaluating solutions

Additional comment - if any, up to 1000
characters

Links to additional materials



Developing key 21st-century skills in students requires their teachers
to make a fundamental change in their approach to teaching. It is
necessary to reformulate teaching to resemble reality and daily
situations. Those situations are complex, and multidisciplinary and
require the connection of knowledge from different fields. They require
analytical and critical thinking, cooperation, and creativity.

Brainfinity methodology and training provide teachers with detailed
guidance and tools to design assignments to encourage students to
collaborate, reflect, discuss, analyze, and be creative. The method is
very demanding, because it requires teachers to release and use their
creativity and work together with their colleagues to prepare tasks for
students. Unlike the standard way of working and approach to
teaching, it requires thinking outside the box and relying on the use of
online tools in the work - which also contributes to the teachers' digital
literacy.
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PART 4 CONCLUSION



There will be a reward for the effort of creating Braininifty tasks.
Already in the class itself, the atmosphere of cooperation, the
excitement and enthusiasm of the students will be a sign that the effort
invested is fully justified. Is there any greater satisfaction for a
dedicated teacher than when the students do not want to leave the
classroom after the lesson is over? Or when students ask: can we
have another assignment? And the experience we have with the
application of this method says that the result will be exactly that. Let's
not even talk about the satisfaction that a teacher has when he sees
off a student who he has prepared for the life and work situations that
await him in the future.

Therefore, release your repressed creativity and dive into the world of
logical problems and detective tasks that we introduced you to through
this training. We're sure you'll enjoy working together and turn your
students into real little Brainfinity detectives!
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TRAININGTRAININGTRAINING
IMPLEMENTATION SETIMPLEMENTATION SETIMPLEMENTATION SET



Introduction

The primary goal of this Training Implementation Set is to supply
school teachers with extra resources and guidance for the effective
delivery of our Brainfinity training program to children aged 11-14. The
Set includes the collection of 50 logical puzzles and detectives’ tasks
created by the project team, that can be used by teachers in their
classrooms; it also includes tools for teacher observation and self-
reflection, forms to track the development of skills and changes in
attitudes, advice on providing constructive feedback to students, and a
survey to evaluate the program's pilot testing. All these components
are thoughtfully designed with a singular objective: to support and
enable teachers in their efforts to foster improved problem-solving
skills in their students.
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Brainfinity Educational Content

Booklet with 50 Brainfininty tasks
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The theoretical background for our training program is the Brainfinity
Educational content. This is the LINK to the version of the booklet in
English

The tasks in this collection are put in order from easier to those more
demanding. It is important to introduce to students first the easier
tasks, and to support them in finding solutions. This way they will get
encouragement to continue to more demanding tasks. You may be
surprised how easy it may be once the students are “infected” with the
Brainfininty virus! LINK

https://drive.google.com/file/d/1LJdCgW8Rb1uP3o1Hgtlr3JbaqYfTbSgL/view?usp=sharing


Observation Forms on Gained Skills and Change in
Attitudes
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These forms serve as a means for teachers to monitor and record the
progression of students' skills and shifts in attitude throughout the
Brainfinity program. They facilitate tracking the individual and
collective growth of students in areas such as logical and analytical
thinking, teamwork, and data mining. By observing changes in
students before and after various segments of the program, teachers
can measure the impact of their instruction. This insight allows them to
adjust their teaching techniques to achieve optimal outcomes.

Link: 3. Brainfinity Assessment tool on Gained Skills and Change in
Students' Attitudes

https://docs.google.com/document/d/1zLDRhy9Yjw2oPdrvgfI0arNfr2KRfgO4ds-F8nqDbxM/edit?usp=drive_link
https://docs.google.com/document/d/1zLDRhy9Yjw2oPdrvgfI0arNfr2KRfgO4ds-F8nqDbxM/edit?usp=drive_link


Tips for providing feedback to students

It is crucial that throughout the problem-solving process, both in the
preparatory and competitive phases, students receive constructive
feedback that will facilitate their rapid progress. That's why we've
developed checklists that will help teachers more easily identify areas
where a student can progress. This makes it easier for teachers to
provide feedback. Based on the checklist, the teacher gives feedback
to the student that should meet the following criteria: 

it must be communicated in language that is close to the student, 
it must be informative, in the sense that the student can infer what
they need to do to progress in the right direction, 
it must be affirmative, not just listing the shortcomings the teacher
has noticed, 

it should be motivational, encouraging the student to explore and solve
problems further.

Link: 4. Brainfinity - Providing feedback to Students
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https://docs.google.com/document/d/1cA6PMS_dxtgEhBznAc2YDyrnQFildsfIPvD0VV1d9ow/edit?usp=drive_link


Checklist for teachers: Preparing your students for
national Brainfinity competition

Survey for Evaluation of the Teachers’ training/Pilot
Testing
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We are sure this training will motivate you to share your new skills in
your classroom. The Brainfininty approach to teaching will be well
accepted by students, we are sure they will enjoy the learning process
as much as you have enjoyed the Brainfinity training. Hoewer, getting
ready for the national competition needs continuous work, so we are
providing you with some useful tips in the form of a checklist.

Link: 5. Brainfinity checklist for teachers: preparing students for
national Brainfininty competition

This form is designed to collect feedback on the pilot testing of our
training program, aiming to understand its effectiveness and gather
suggestions for improvement.

Link: Evaluation survey

https://docs.google.com/document/d/1zNPh7tW5HO3Q5qqR_X-MtlGMJY_ZySp-cEQsfPZo9mY/edit?usp=drive_link
https://docs.google.com/document/d/1zNPh7tW5HO3Q5qqR_X-MtlGMJY_ZySp-cEQsfPZo9mY/edit?usp=drive_link
https://docs.google.com/forms/d/1PJXpqTaBtIEplKGsRnAEU6SD26Ho6N9PZabJD5D7vNY/edit
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